
For starters
Red lentil soup served
with croutons and butter.
~
Tuna tartar with toasted
bread and garnish.
~
Homemade rabbit Pâté
with cranberry and orange
chutney and brioche
bread.

To follow
Norfolk turkey roulade
stuffed with pancetta and
liver served with roasted
potatoes, brussel sprouts
and cider turkey gravy.
~
Roast sirloin rolled with
English mustard served
with roasted potatoes,
seasonal vegetables,
Yorkshire pudding and
rich gravy.

Desserts
Winter berries
crème brûlée.
~
Dark chocolate
cheesecake.

Atlantic monkfish
panfried, wrapped in
prosciutto, with lentils
salad and Ratte potatoes.

Goats cheese in puff
pastry oven baked with
crunchy salad and
cranberry sauce (v).

Christmas pudding
with brandy custard.
~
Cheese board.
~
Tea or coffee.

Please book in
advance £25.95


